
From: Bill Rooney
To: "Audie Sciumbato"
Subject: RE: Agreement
Date: Tuesday, September 15, 2009 6:29:00 PM
Attachments: Invoice 2009-1005 - Underwood Associates.pdf

Audie:
 
Attached is the signed agreement, an invoice and a receipt for the airline flights. 
 
I'll put the originals in the mail.   Please remit payment to my home address (on the invoice). 
 
Thanks,
 
bill
 
 
Dr. William L. Rooney
Professor, Sorghum Breeding and Genetics
Chair, Plant Release Committee
Texas A&M University
College Station, Texas 77843-2474
979 845 2151 

-----Original Message-----
From: Audie Sciumbato [mailto:Audie.Sciumbato@uwlaw.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, September 15, 2009 1:28 PM
To: Bill Rooney
Subject: RE: Agreement

That's perfectly acceptable.  I'll turn your invoice and travel expenses in as soon as we receive
them.
 
Thanks again-
Audie

From: Bill Rooney [mailto:wlr@tamu.edu] 
Sent: Tuesday, September 15, 2009 1:25 PM
To: Audie Sciumbato
Subject: RE: Agreement

Audie:
 
I think the agreement works for me
 
If charged on an hourly basis, that would be 13 hours for the day, leaving at 7:00 am and
returning at 8:00 pm. 
 
Is that interpretation acceptable? 
 
Once clarified, I'll sign, return and include an invoice for hours and travel. 
 
regards, 
 

mailto:wlr@tamu.edu
mailto:Audie.Sciumbato@uwlaw.com



Dr. William L. Rooney 
Consulting Services - Sorghum Breeding and Genetics 
 
September 15, 2009 
 
15392 I & GN Road 
College Station, Texas 77845 
Phone:  979.220.1951 
Fax:  979.862.1931 
E-mail:  wlr@tamu.edu 
 
INVOICE 
 
BILL TO: Date:  
Underwood Law 
Attn: Audie Sciumbato 
P.O. Box 9158 
Amarillo, Texas 79105-9158  


Invoice #: 2009-1005 


 
Quantity Description Rate Amount 


 Consulting Activities:    
13 hour September 14, 2009: Left College Station 


at 7 am and flew to Amarillo, Texas and 
consult on sterility problems in the forage 
sorghum FS5.  Traveled with Audie 
Sciumbato and Lynn Tate, met with 
several farmers.  Return to College 
Station, arriving at 8 pm.     


$160/hour $2,080.00 


1 ticket Continental Airlines: CLL to AMA and 
round trip (receipt attached) 


$715.40 $715.40 


 Total 
 


 $2,795.40 


 
 
 



















bill
 
Dr. William L. Rooney
Professor, Sorghum Breeding and Genetics
Chair, Plant Release Committee
Texas A&M University
College Station, Texas 77843-2474
979 845 2151 

-----Original Message-----
From: Audie Sciumbato [mailto:Audie.Sciumbato@uwlaw.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, September 15, 2009 1:16 PM
To: Bill Rooney
Subject: Agreement

Hi, Dr. Rooney-
 
I hope that you made it back to B/CS alright last night.  Attached is a copy of a basic
expert witness agreement.  If it looks okay to you, please sign it and mail it back to us.
 
We know that there is still some question regarding the 'higher ups' disallowing your work
as an expert witness in this matter, and we are ready and willing to modify (or dissolve)
this agreement if necessary.  However, for now, having some form of written agreement
in place really helps us out.
 
As always, please e-mail or call if you have any questions or concerns.  Otherwise, I
hope to hear from you soon.  Thanks again for all of your time and help.
 
Sincerely,
Audie
 

Audie Sciumbato, PhD
Associate Attorney
Underwood Law Firm
P.O. Box 9158
Amarillo, Texas 79105 
www.uwlaw.com
Phone: (806) 379-0326
Fax: (806) 379-0316

NOTICE: This communication may contain privileged or confidential
information. If you are not the intended recipient or have received it in
error, please advise the sender by reply email and immediately delete
this email and any attachments without reading, copying or disclosing the
contents. If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying,
distribution or use of the contents is prohibited. Your receipt of this
communication is not intended to waive any applicable privilege.

CIRCULAR 230 NOTICE: To ensure compliance with requirements
imposed by the IRS, we inform you that any U.S. federal tax advice
contained in this communication (including any attachments) is not
intended or written to be used, and cannot be used, for the purpose of
(i) avoiding penalties under the Internal Revenue Code or (ii) promoting,
marketing or recommending to another party any transaction or matter

blocked::http://www.uwlaw.com/


addressed herein.
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