
From: Pam Wilhelm
To: Bill Rooney
Subject: RE: South Dakota State U account 503884
Date: Monday, November 09, 2009 8:09:08 AM

According to FAMIS the total award is   Short Title is Feedstock Partnership Award #
3TA153/Prine: DE-FC36-05G085041
It only has accounts for you and Heilman
Here's the printout of the Summary Budget Pool since the account started:
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Let me know if you need anything else or I can help.

>>> "Bill Rooney" <wlr@tamu.edu> 11/5/2009 5:52 PM >>>
Pam:

mailto:PWilhelm@ag.tamu.edu
mailto:wlr@tamu.edu


I've been looking at the SDSU proposal we submitted; the numbers don't match
with what you've got listed below.  According to the attached, we were due

 so it doesn't match. 

As far as I know this is the only funds that I have coming from SDSU.  Can
you reconcile this or give me a title or copy of the budgeting instructions?

Regards,

Bill

Dr. William L. Rooney
Professor, Sorghum Breeding and Genetics
Chair, Plant Release Committee
Texas A&M University
College Station, Texas 77843-2474
979 845 2151

-----Original Message-----
From: Pam Wilhelm [mailto:PWilhelm@ag.tamu.edu]
Sent: Thursday, September 10, 2009 9:52 AM
To: Bill L Rooney
Subject: South Dakota State U account 503884

Dr. Rooney,  this account has received new funding.  I noticed you had set
up a support account for Heilman that says Interim funding.  Just wanted to
check with you as to where the new funds should go.
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