From: Bill Rooney

To: "Karen L Prihoda"

Subject: FW: Invoice from SCSC IT Resources
Date: Wednesday, August 26, 2009 5:45:00 PM
Attachments: Inv_25_from_SCSC_IT_Resourc.pdf

Please print and account it (to one of the ones that is expiring). I'll sign and you can send it back.

bill

Dr. William L. Rooney

Professor, Sorghum Breeding and Genetics
Chair, Plant Release Committee

Texas A&M University

College Station, Texas 77843-2474

979 845 2151

----- Original Message-----

From: SCSC IT Resources [mailto:klabar@ag.tamu.edu]
Sent: Wednesday, August 26, 2009 3:12 PM
To: wir@tamu.edu

Subject: Invoice from SCSC IT Resources

Dear Bill Rooney :

Your invoice is attached. Please remit payment at your earliest convenience.
Thank you for your business - we appreciate it very much.

Sincerely,

SCSC IT Resources
979-845-3913

To view your invoice

Open the attached PDF file. You must have Acrobat® Reader® installed to view the
attachment.


mailto:wlr@tamu.edu
mailto:k-prihoda@tamu.edu
http://www.adobe.com/products/acrobat/readstep2.html
http://www.adobe.com/products/acrobat/readstep2.html
http://www.adobe.com/products/acrobat/readstep2.html
http://www.adobe.com/products/acrobat/readstep2.html

Invoice

SCSC IT Resources .
Date Invoice #
Soil & Crop Sciences 8/4/2009 25
TAMU 2474
College Station, TN 77843-2474
Bill To
Soil & Crop Scieces
Dr. Bill Rooney
Account # P.O. No. Terms Project
Quantity Description Rate Serviced Amount
Troubleshoot slow Internet performance/lockups in 40.00| 1/9/2009 40.00
IE on Karen Prihoda's PC. MSN toolbar causing
problems-removed-rebooted
Troubleshoot Internet Explorer adware/hijack 40.00 | 1/22/2009 160.00
problem. Remove outdated Norton Antivirus
2003-install Symantec Endpoint Protection 1
Troubleshoot AC power adapter connectivity 40.00 | 2/11/2009 80.00
problem on DelRoy's laptop-bend internal connector
pins out to make better contact-test on
Troubleshoot antivirus360 problem on DelRoy's 40.00 | 2/26/2009 40.00
laptop.
Continued troubleshooting antivirus360 problem on 40.00 | 2/27/2009 40.00
DelRoy's laptop
Re-establish connection and shared connection for 40.00 | 4/8/2009 40.00
HP LJ 2100 on Karen's front desk PC
Take inventory of two Dell Dimension 8300 PC's at 40.00 | 4/20/2009 80.00
the seed foundation building and check on
laserjet2100 on Karen's desk-needed paper
Check on DelRoy's Dell Inspirion 8500 laptop pwer 40.00 | 4/29/2009 40.00
adapter problem. Bring two student worker PC's
back to office to re-install Windows and applications
Reinstall windows on student Dell Inspiron 8300 pc 40.00 | 4/30/2009 80.00
Continue setting up student PCs with programs and 40.00 | 5/4/2009 80.00
updates
Setup student PC's and re-establish connection to 40.005/6/2009 40.00
printers in front office.
Pickup DelRoy's laptop and disassemble to prepare 40.00 | 5/21/2009 40.00
for installation of new DC jack on the motherboard.
Remove old DC jack and install new one on Dell 40.0015/22/2009 160.00
Inspiron 8500 motherboard. Test for proper
operation.
Total
Phone # Fax # E-mail Web Site
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979-845-3913

979-845-0456

klabar@ag.tamu.edu
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Invoice

SCSC IT Resources .
Date Invoice #
Soil & Crop Sciences 8/4/2009 25
TAMU 2474
College Station, TN 77843-2474
Bill To
Soil & Crop Scieces
Dr. Bill Rooney
P.O. No. Terms Project
Account # )
Quantity Rate Serviced Amount
1 | Telco w/Del Roy re: Dell laptop power connection 40.00 | 5/28/2009 40.00
not charging his battery battery is ok. works in
another laptop. Power connection on laptop not
charging the battery
1 | Remove corrupt print jobs from Karen's PC and test 40.0017/1/2009 40.00
shared connection to her HP LI 2100 printer
Total $1,000.00
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