
From: Bill Rooney
To: "Nilesh Dighe"
Subject: FW: FW: PO
Date: Thursday, October 01, 2009 7:36:00 AM
Attachments: PO (2.42 KB).msg

Dr. William L. Rooney
Professor, Sorghum Breeding and Genetics
Chair, Plant Release Committee
Texas A&M University
College Station, Texas 77843-2474
979 845 2151

-----Original Message-----
From: Lindra G Blum [mailto:lg-blum@tamu.edu]
Sent: Monday, September 28, 2009 2:40 PM
To: Bill L Rooney
Subject: Fwd: FW: PO

P.O. for $2300.00  is L004079
Lindra

>>> Sonnie Feagley 9/28/2009 2:01 PM >>>

mailto:wlr@tamu.edu
mailto:nileshdighe@neo.tamu.edu
mailto:lg-blum@tamu.edu

FW: PO

		From

		Bill Rooney

		To

		'Sonnie Feagley'

		Cc

		'Nilesh Dighe'

		Recipients

		sk-feagley@tamu.edu; nileshdighe@neo.tamu.edu



The project funds (and account) that I am looking for is entitled: 



Establishing the Relationship between Forage Sorghum Composition and

Bioenergy Composition Values 



It was funded by the United Sorghum Checkoff Program.  



The amount was $35,347.00



The funded proposal is attached.  



If those funds cannot be found, we will need a P.O. for Dairy One for forage

analysis.  If these funds are not available, 503900-84720.  Nilesh can

provide you with a close estimate of the total cost and a description of

purchase.  



Regards, 



Bill 



Dr. William L. Rooney

Professor, Sorghum Breeding and Genetics

Chair, Plant Release Committee

Texas A&M University

College Station, Texas 77843-2474

979 845 2151 





-----Original Message-----

From: Nilesh Dighe [mailto:nileshdighe@neo.tamu.edu] 

Sent: Thursday, September 24, 2009 7:48 PM

To: Bill Rooney

Subject: PO





Dr. Rooney-



Did you get a chance to request PO for the DairyOne Wet-Chem project?  I was

planning on sending samples to DairyOne, tomorrow.



Nilesh







From: Bill Rooney
To: "Sonnie Feagley"
Cc: "Nilesh Dighe"
Subject: FW: PO
Date: Monday, September 28, 2009 6:45:50 AM

The project funds (and account) that I am looking for is entitled:

Establishing the Relationship between Forage Sorghum Composition and
Bioenergy Composition Values

It was funded by the United Sorghum Checkoff Program. 

The amount was 

The funded proposal is attached. 

If those funds cannot be found, we will need a P.O. for Dairy One for forage
analysis.  If these funds are not available, 503900-84720.  Nilesh can
provide you with a close estimate of the total cost and a description of
purchase. 

Regards,

Bill

Dr. William L. Rooney
Professor, Sorghum Breeding and Genetics
Chair, Plant Release Committee
Texas A&M University
College Station, Texas 77843-2474
979 845 2151

-----Original Message-----
From: Nilesh Dighe [mailto:nileshdighe@neo.tamu.edu]
Sent: Thursday, September 24, 2009 7:48 PM
To: Bill Rooney
Subject: PO

Dr. Rooney-

Did you get a chance to request PO for the DairyOne Wet-Chem project?  I was
planning on sending samples to DairyOne, tomorrow.

Nilesh
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