
From: Amir M Ibrahim
To: David Baltensperger; Steve Hague; cwsmith@tamu.edu; Russell Sutton; wlr@tamu.edu
Cc: sethmurray@neo.tamu.edu; Carol Rhodes; Glenda Kurten; Judy Young
Subject: Agronomix Software Renewal
Date: Tuesday, November 03, 2009 10:56:44 AM

Dear Dr. Baltensperger,

It is time to renew the Agrobase Gen II licence.  We have licences for
Ibrahim (2), B. Rooney (2), Hague/Smith (1), the students' lab (1).
Russell Sutton has been being paying for his licence (under Bhoja Raj's
name who is doing research in the Commerce area).  I am not sure whether
or not Seth needs a student licence.

We pay for one main licence. The others are student licenses that cost
$200 each.

All of these licences need to be renewed this month to prevent
interrupted use of the database.  The total cost is CAD $1668.10.  I am
always available to provide a one-day training workshop per semester.
Also, each licence comes with great, full technical support.  Thanks a
lot.

Best regards,
Amir

-------------------------------------
Amir Ibrahim, Ph.D.
Associate Professor,
Small Grains Breeder/Geneticist
Dep. of Soil and Crop Sciences
College of Agriculture and Life Sciences
Texas A&M University
2474 TAMU
College Station, Texas 77843-2474
Work: (979) 845-8274
Fax: (979) 845-0456

>>> "Agronomix Software - Service & Sales" <service@agronomix.mb.ca>
11/3/2009 9:50 AM >>>
Amir,

The names I have are as follows:

Kerry Mayfield
Dusten Borden
Jenny Bailey
Mohamed Ali
Student Lab
Bhoja Raj Basnet

Kind regards,
Chris Leonard
Service and Sales Associate

AGRONOMIX SOFTWARE, INC.
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171 Waterloo Street
Winnipeg, Manitoba R3N 0S4
W direct 204.487.4245 |   fax 204.487.4250
  e-mail service@agronomix.mb.ca
( web www.agronomix.com

***This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and
intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are
addressed. If you have received this email in error please notify
Agronomix Software, Inc immediately. Thank-you.***

-----Original Message-----
From: Amir M Ibrahim [mailto:AIbrahim@ag.tamu.edu]
Sent: November-03-09 9:55 AM
To: Agronomix Software - Service & Sales
Subject: Re: Agronomix Software Inc. - Generation II Annual Renewal
Followup

Can you send me the names of the students on this account?  Thanks.

-------------------------------------
Amir Ibrahim, Ph.D.
Associate Professor,
Small Grains Breeder/Geneticist
Dep. of Soil and Crop Sciences
College of Agriculture and Life Sciences
Texas A&M University
2474 TAMU
College Station, Texas 77843-2474
Work: (979) 845-8274
Fax: (979) 845-0456

>>> "Agronomix Software - Service & Sales" <service@agronomix.mb.ca>
11/2/2009 10:28 AM >>>
Dear Amir,

Re: 0212GEN-01

This is a friendly reminder to inform you that we have not yet
received
payment for Invoice 090800016, dated August 31, 2009. The invoice
total
is
CAD $1668.10 for the renewal of your AGROBASE Generation II software
license. We would greatly appreciate notification of the status
regarding
this annual renewal.

For your convenience, I have attached an electronic copy of the
invoice
for
your review. If the payment has already been processed, it would be
most
helpful if you could provide payment details for us to track from our
end.

mailto:AIbrahim@ag.tamu.edu


Thank you for your continued support. I look forward to your reply.

Have a great day!

Sincerely,

Chris Leonard

Service and Sales Associate

AGRONOMIX SOFTWARE, INC.

171 Waterloo Street

Winnipeg, Manitoba R3N 0S4

( direct 204.487.4245 | 7 fax 204.487.4250
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***This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and
intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they
are
addressed. If you have received this email in error please notify
Agronomix
Software, Inc immediately. Thank-you.***
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